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  MARK YOUR CALENDAR: 
 SPIRIT WEEK: 
 9/26-Mismatch Day 
 9/27-Monochrome Day 
 9/28-Sports Day 
 9/29- Extreme School Spirit Day 
 9/30- Crazy Sock Day 
 9/29- VIP Assembly TK-3rd 9am; Cafeteria 
 

SPIRIT WEEK starts on Monday, 9/26, and will be our first spirit week of the year. Students 
brought home a flyer with more details. Classrooms with the most spirit will have a popcorn 
part on Friday the 30th.  
 
FREE CAR SEAT SAFETY checks will be available Saturday, 9/24/22, from 9am-1pm at the 
Diana J White Cancer Institute at 900 Mono Way in Sonora. Call (209) 533-7401 for 
questions or to schedule another seat check date. See the flyer on the back of the newsletter 
sent home for more details.   
 
KIDS DAY at the Peaceful Valley Farmer’s Market will be on Friday, 9/30/22, from 4pm – 
6:30pm. There will be booths and activities for kids including a free scavenger hunt; kids who 
complete the scavenger hunt will receive “veggie bucks” to spend on fruits and veggies at the 
market. Free pumpkins will also be available to take home. The farmer’s market is located at 
14888 Peaceful Valley rd. (across from Tractor Supply). 
 
YOUTH BASKETBALL at Sonora Sports and Fitness is back! The league is available for 
girls and boys ages 6-11. Registration is $65.00 and is open until 9/23/22 for girls and 
12/9/22 for boys. Register online at www.sonorafitness.com or call (209) 532-1202 for more 
information.  

 
FOOD FOR KIDS is a program, in partnership with the ATCAA food bank, which provides 
weekly food bags for children who qualify. We are in need of a volunteer to pick up the food 
weekly and deliver it to the classrooms. The food is picked up in Jamestown and is pre-
bagged and ready to be labeled and delivered. If you would like to volunteer please call the 
school office, (209) 586-3266, for more information. 

 
ATTENDANCE is important to help your student build good school habits. Consistent 
attendance in TK and Kindergarten is especially important to help your children develop 
routines that continue throughout school. To help make mornings successful set a regular 
bedtime and morning routine, lay out clothes and backpacks the night before, and set an 
alarm clock for yourself and your student. Please call the office when your student is absent 
from school. Without verification your student’s absence will be marked as unexcused. 
 
EVERY WEDNESDAY IS A MINIMUM DAY – DISMISSAL IS 1:40 PM FOR GRADES 1-8.  
 
GO BRAVES! 
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