

**TWAIN HARTE SCHOOL DISTRICT BOARD OF EDUCATION TRUSTEES  
BOARD MEETING AGENDA**

**Meeting Location:**

22974 Twain Harte Drive, Board Room, Twain Harte, CA 95383

*To attend this meeting in person, per COVID-19 State guidelines, masks are required*

*This meeting will be recorded. The recording will be stored for 30 days.*

**Wednesday, August 11, 2021**

This public meeting may be attended virtually via Zoom:

<https://us02web.zoom.us/j/85053887122?pwd=NU1oRU9jdm5lRXB0NSU3YnNaUytXUT09>

Meeting ID: 850 5388 7122

Passcode: 736452

**PUBLIC SESSION-** The Public Session will begin at 4:00 p.m.

**1. CALL TO ORDER**

1.1 Pledge of Allegiance

1.2 Roll Call

1.3 Agenda Review & Adoption

Recommendation: For Approval

**2. COMMENTS FROM THE PUBLIC**

*(The public may address the Board on any matter pertaining to the district that is not on the agenda.)*

**3. PUBLIC HEARING**

3.1 Open Public Hearing

- Public input regarding Resolution No. 2021-2022-08-01

- Public input regarding Board Policy and Resolution 6158 Independent Study

3.2 Close Public Hearing

The Board will close the Public Hearing

**4. REPORTS**

4.1 Superintendent/Principal Report

4.2 Board Reports

4.3 Staff Reports

4.3 Enrollment

**5. CONSENT AGENDA**

*(The Board will consider all of the following items by a single vote unless any member of the Board or the public asks that an item be removed from the Consent Agenda and be considered separately.)*

5.1 Minutes from June 22, 2021, June 23, 2021, and July 7, 2021

5.2 Warrants through July 30, 2021

5.3 Williams Uniform Complaint Quarterly Report-July 2021

5.4 Consideration of Probationary Certificated Employee, Teacher-Simone Vega

5.5 Consideration of Short-Term Classified Employee, Technology Assistant-Melanie Foley

5.6 Consideration of Overnight Field Trip Grades 6-8, Nature Bridge-Science Camp: 9/20-9/22

5.7 Consideration of District Management/Confidential Salary Schedule 2021/2022

5.8 Consideration of Classified Employee, 3-hour Probationary Paraeducator -Magaly DeGroot

5.9 Consideration of Classified Employee, 3-hour Probationary Paraeducator – Alyssa Dunlap

5.10 Consideration of Classified Employee, .75-hour increase in Probationary Paraeducator (4.50 total hours) – Nicole Vinson

5.11 Consideration of Approval of Behavior Support Services, Tucci Learning Solutions

## 6. EDUCATION

- 6.1 Consideration of Approval of Resolution No. 2021-2022-08-01: Sufficiency of Instructional Materials

Rationale: Education Code 60119 requires the governing board to declare sufficient textbooks and materials are available for students in specific instructional areas. Staff reports sufficient instructional materials in all state required areas.

Recommendation: For Approval

- 6.2 Annual Statement of Need 30-Day Substitute and Designated Subjects Teaching Permits

Recommendation: For Approval

- 6.3 Declaration of Need for Fully Qualified Educator 2021-2022

The District will submit the Declaration of Need for Fully Qualified Educators to Commission on Teacher Credentialing for the school year 2021-2022

Recommendation: For Approval

- 6.4 Consideration of Approval to Eliminate BP6157 Distance Learning

Rationale: This policy was introduced to establish guidelines for distance learning during the COVID-19 shut down, it is no longer relevant.

Recommendation: For Approval

- 6.5 Consideration of Approval for Revision to BP/AR 6158 Independent Study

Rationale: Current policy and regulation need to be revised to comply with new state legislation.

Recommendation: For Approval

## 7. FISCAL SERVICES

- 7.1 Consideration of Resolution 2021-2022-08-02 In the Matter of Authorizing Temporary Transfer of Funds from the Borrowing Between Funds.

Recommendation: For Approval

- 7.2 Consideration of Adopting the 45-Day Budget Update 2020-2021

Recommendation: For Approval

## 8. ADJOURNMENT

**Next Regular Board Meeting of the Twain Harte Board of Education is**

**Wednesday September 8, 2021, 4:00 p.m.**

**In the Board Room at Twain Harte School, 22974 Twain Harte Drive, Twain Harte, CA 95383**

**Agenda material may be reviewed at the District Office, M-F 8:30 a.m. - 3:00 p.m.**

Agenda posted by Robyn Moore on July 30, 2021 at the following locations: Twain Harte School, Twain Harte District Office and the Twain Harte website. Agenda emailed to: Tuolumne County Schools Office, the Union Democrat, Clark Broadcasting and all Board Members.

In compliance with the Americans with Disabilities Act, if you need special assistance (i.e. auxiliary aids or services) in order to participate in this meeting, please contact the District Office at 209-586-3772 for assistance. Notification 48 hours prior to the start of the meeting will enable the staff to make reasonable arrangements to ensure accessibility at the meeting.

To have a copy of this agenda and/or any supporting documentation emailed to you, email [rjmoore@twainharteschool.com](mailto:rjmoore@twainharteschool.com) by 1pm August 9, 2021 with your request.

# **PUBLIC HEARING**

August 11, 2021  
Twain Harte School District

*To attend this Public Hearing in person, per COVID-19 State guidelines, masks are required.  
To attend virtually please use the link below.*

Join Zoom Meeting:

<https://us02web.zoom.us/j/85053887122?pwd=NU1oRU9jdM5lRXB0NSt3YnNaUytXUT09>

Meeting ID: 850 5388 7122

Passcode: 736452

The public is offered the opportunity to give input  
and express concerns regarding the:

**Twain Harte School District**  
**Board Policy & Regulation 6158, Independent Study**  
**(CCR, Title 5, Section 11701)**

*Education Code Section 60119 (as revised by Chapter 704, Statutes of 2006 and California Code of Regulations (CCR), Title 5, Section 9531).*

Agenda material may be reviewed on the District Office  
22974 Twain Harte Drive, Twain Harte, CA 95383  
between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 3:00 p.m.

This notice was posted by Robyn Moore on July 30, 2021 at the following locations: Twain Harte School and Twain Harte District Office and on the school website, [twainharteschool.com](http://twainharteschool.com). Posting emailed to: Tuolumne County Schools Office, the Union Democrat, Clark Broadcasting (93.5 KKBN) and all Board Members.

To have a copy of this agenda emailed to you, email [rjmoore@twainharteschool.com](mailto:rjmoore@twainharteschool.com) by 1pm, 07/29/21 with your request.

This Public Hearing Notice posted on 07/30/21.

# **PUBLIC HEARING**

August 11, 2021  
Twain Harte School District

*To attend this Public Hearing in person, per COVID-19 State guidelines, masks are required.  
To attend virtually please use the link below.*

Join Zoom Meeting:

<https://us02web.zoom.us/j/85053887122?pwd=NU1oRU9jdM5lRXB0NSU3YnNaUytXUT09>

Meeting ID: 850 5388 7122

Passcode: 736452

The public is offered the opportunity to give input  
and express concerns regarding the:

**Twain Harte School District**  
**Sufficiency of Instructional Materials for 2021-2022**  
*Education Code Section 60119 (as revised by Chapter 704, Statutes of 2006 and California Code of Regulations (CCR), Title 5, Section 9531).*

Agenda material may be reviewed on the District Office  
22974 Twain Harte Drive, Twain Harte, CA 95383  
between the hours of 8:30 a.m. and 3:00 p.m.

This notice was posted by Robyn Moore on July 30, 2021 at the following locations: Twain Harte School and Twain Harte District Office and on the school website, [twainharteschool.com](http://twainharteschool.com). Posting emailed to: Tuolumne County Schools Office, the Union Democrat, Clark Broadcasting (93.5 KKBN) and all Board Members.

To have a copy of this agenda emailed to you, email [rjmoore@twainharteschool.com](mailto:rjmoore@twainharteschool.com) by 1pm, 07/29/21 with your request.

This Public Hearing Notice posted on 07/30/21.